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New Faculty Members Arrive for 1980-81 Year 
Freshmen, first-year and transfer 

students aren't the only fresh faces on 
campus. The faculty appointments for 
the 1980-81 academic year bring new¬ 
comers to almost every department and 
school at the College. 

Joining the faculty of the Marshall- 
Wythe School of Law are John 
Bernard Corr, Assistant Professor (J.D., 
Georgetown University Law Center); 
Fredric Ira Lederer, Associate Professor 
(S.J.D. expected 1980, University of 
Virginia School of Law); Margit 
Livingston, Visiting Professor (LL. M., 
University of Illinois College of Law); 
Gerald Paul Moran, Visiting Professor 

Chinese Scholars 
To Visit Campus 

Fifteen Chinese scholars will be visit¬ 
ing on campus Monday, September 8 
and have expressed the wish to have 
students and faculty join them when 
they meet for lunch at The Commons 
between 12:30- 1:30 p.m. 

Craig N. Canning of the history 
faculty, who will be campus host for the 
visitors, said they would like to have an 
opportunity to chat with members of 
the college community while they are 
here. 

Canning said the scholars represent 
many different fields including law and 
communications, and some are mem¬ 
bers of government ministries in 
Peking; many are teachers. Almost all 
have been in the United States 
studying for six months or longer. 
There will be no language barrier, said 
Canning. 

The National Committee for U.S.¬ 
China Relations is planning the visit, 
which is the first stop of an itinerary 
which will take the visitors to Washing¬ 
ton, Philadelphia, New York and New 
England for an introduction to 
American life in the older, more tra¬ 
ditional cities of the country. 

The Chinese scholars will arrive in 
Williamsburg on Sunday and will spend 
most of that day touring Colonial 
Williamsburg. They will meet on 
campus Monday morning for three 
lectures by members of the history 
faculty and. after a tourof the campus, 
will have lunch at The Commons. John 
E. Selby, graduate dean of arts and 
sciences and professor of history, will 
lecture on the origins of political 
institutions in Virginia. James L. Axtell 
will give a slide lecture entitled "The 
Invasion of North America - An Indian 
Perspective." Cam Walker will lecture 
on Blacks in the Civil War. 

Canning explained that the sponsor¬ 
ing committee works on a reciprocal 
program with groups from the U.S. 
going to China. 

(LL.M., Graduate School of Public 
Law, George Washington University); 
James N. Christman, Lecturer-Spring 
(J.D., University of Michigan Law 
School); Frank H. Marsh, Lecturer 
(J.D., University of Tennessee); Gordon 
B. Tayloe. Jr., Lecturer-Spring (J.D., 
Wake Forest University); Jerrold G. 
Weinberg, Lecturer (LL.B., University 
of Virginia). 

The School of Business Administra¬ 
tion greets Wendell E. Dunn, Assistant 
Professor (Ph.D. expected 1980, Uni- 
versity of Michigan); Krista Dudley 
Carpenter, Lecturer-Spring (MBA, 
College of William and Mary); Sheldon 
M. Franck, Lecturer (LL.M., Marshall- 
Wythe School of Law); Ellwood C. 
Hurford, Lecturer (M.S., University of 
Pennsylvania); John Parkany. Richard 
S. Reynolds, Jr., Professor (Ph.D., 
Columbia University); Rebecca M. 
Pliske, Visiting Assistant Professor 
(Ph.D. expected 1980, Bowling Green 
State University); Joseph H. Steele, 
Lecturer (B.A., College of William and 
Mary); Ahmed S. Zaki, Assistant 
Professor (Ph.D., University of Wash¬ 
ington); Denton C. Roberts, Lecturer 
(J.D., University of Virginia); Daniel 
Pliske, Visiting Assistant Professor 
(Ph.D. expected, Bowling Green State 
University); Judith Ewart, Lecturer 
(MBA, College of William and Mary); 
John C. McDonald, Lecturer (MBA, 
College of William and Mary); Debra B. 
Canfield, Lecturer (Ph.D. expected, 
Syracuse University). 

The Department of English welcomes 
Richard Ruland. Visiting Professor 
(Ph.D., University of Michigan); Stanley 
Lourdeaux, Assistant Professor (Ph.D., 
University of Chicago); Michael A. 
North, Assistant Professor (Ph.D., Uni¬ 
versity of Connecticut); Joanne M. 
Braxton, Instructor (Ph.D. expected 
1980, Yale University); Marlene B. 
Davis, Lecturer (M.S., University of 
Virginia); Thomas Travisano. Instructor 
(Ph.D., University of Virginia); 
Katherine D. Wolterink, Lecturer (M.A., 
The University of Santa Clara); 
Stephen Marlowe, Writer-in-Residence 
(M.A., Hofstra College-the first Writer- 
in-Residence at William and Mary in 
1974). 

Joining the Chemistry Department 
are Gary C. DeFotis, Assistant Pro¬ 
fessor (Ph.D., The University of 
Chicago); Robert Clay Miller, Visiting 
Professor (Ph.D., Temple University); 
James V. Quagliano, Visiting Professor 
(Ph.D., University of Illinois); Theodore 
D. Putnam, Instructor (M.S., Auburn 
University); Caroline Delaney Miller, 
Visiting Professor (Ph.D., Temple 
University). 

New to the Department of Eco¬ 
nomics are Susan F. Feiner, Visiting 
Assistant Professui (Ph.D. expected, 
University of Massachusetts); William E. 
Reid, Jr., Assistant Professor (Ph.D. 
expected 1980, University of Virginia); 

Louis H. Henry. Visiting Associate Pro¬ 
fessor (Ph.D., University of Notre 
Dame). 

The Philosophy Department wel¬ 
comes Thomas C. Brickhouse, Visiting 
Professor (Ph.D., Vanderbilt Univer¬ 
sity); Lyle E. Angene. Associate 
Professor (Ph.D.. The University of 
Chicago); Alvin E. Keaton, Visiting 
Associate Professor (Ph.D., University 
of Oklahoma). 

Joining the Department of Modem 
Languages are Elizabeth H. Cibula, 
Acting Instructor (M.A., University of 
Virginia); Ruth C. Fraser, Acting 
Instructor (M.A., University of New 
Mexico); Ann Edie. Instructor (M.A., 
Seton Hall University). 

New to the History Department are 
Thomas Main Doerflinger, Assistant 
Professor and Fellow to the Institute of 
Early American History and Culture 
(Ph.D., Harvard University); Jeremy 
Noakes, Visiting Associate Professor 
(Ph.D., Oxon); George Rude' James 
Pinckney Harrison Professor (Ph.D., 
University of London). 

The Psychology Department wel¬ 
comes Robert Gumey, Visiting Assistant 
Professor (Ph.D., Michigan State Uni¬ 
versity); Lynda J. Birckhead, Staff 
Psychologist and Acting Lecturer (Ph.D. 

expected 1980, University of 
Maryland); Frances Slocumb. Visiting 
Assistant Professor (Ph.D. expected, 
Virginia Commonwealth University). 

Joining the Department of Mathe¬ 
matics and Computer Science are 
Marian R. Hoyle, Visiting Assistant 
Professor (M.S., College of William and 
Mary); Joseph P. Minne, Assistant 
Professor (Ph.D. expected 1980, Uni¬ 
versity of California, Irvine). 

The Physics Department welcomes 
three new faculty members: John 
Phillip Bensel, Instructor (Ph.D., Uni¬ 
versity of Pennsylvania); Henry 
Krakauer, Assistant Professor (Ph.D., 
Brandeis University); Richard D. Hart, 
Research Associate (Ph.D., College of 
William and Mary). 

New to the Religion Department are 
Oliver Larry Yarbrough, Visiting Assis¬ 
tant Professor. (Ph.D. expected 1982, 
Yale University) and John Frederick 
Woolverton, Visiting Professor (Ph.D., 
Columbia University). 

The two new members of the 
Anthropology Department are Eric O. 
Ayisi, Visiting Associate Professor 
(Ph.D., University of London) and 
Darrel L. Miller, Assistant Professor 

Cont. on P. 3 

Heads Up 
With fall classes in full swing, a familiar sight returns to the campus-the 

Walking Reader. 
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Newsmakers 
Jonathan Strauss' article, "The 

Yugoslav Economic System" and his 
review of Self Governing Socialism by 
B. Horvat et al, appeared in the July 
issue of the Journal of Comparative 
Economics. 

He also presented an invited paper in 
May at the Minnesota Symposium on 
Agricultural Research. The paper, 
"Social Objective Functions in Agricul¬ 
tural Research," will appear in the 
forthcoming proceedings. 

The executors of the estate of the 
late Professor R. Holdren have invited 
Professor Strauss to revise the manu¬ 
script of Professor Holdren's "Inter¬ 
mediate Economic Theory" for publica¬ 
tion by Iowa State University Press. 

James F. Harris of the philosophy 
department has had three articles 
published by professional journals. 
They include "Philosophy of the 
Sexes" in Teaching Philosophy, 
"Speech Acts and God Talk" in The 
International Journal for the Philosophy 
of Religion, and "Abduction and the 

New Riddle of Induction' 
Monist. 

in The 

Edgar W. Williams of the music 
department was present for the August 
16 premiere of his Amoretti for viola 
and piano (1980) as a fellow at the 
Composer's Conference and Chamber 
Music Center at Johnson, Vt. Amoreti, 
selected for inclusion on the center's 
final concert, was performed by the 
New York violist, Judith Geist, and the 
pianist, Gary Smart 

Margaret K. Schaefer, assistant pro¬ 
fessor of mathematics and computer 
science, will present a paper entitled 
"Optimal Allocation of Repairable 
Spares Among Spares Pools" at the 
Southeastern Regional Meeting of the 
Institute of Management Science, 
October 8 - 10, in Virginia Beach. The 
papier will be published in the proceed¬ 
ings of the meeting. 

Schaefer has also been awarded a 
grant of $31,057 from the National 
Aeronautics and Space Administration 

for her research work in "Optimizing 
Maintenance Models for Advanced 
Avionics Control Systems." The pur¬ 
pose of this research project is to 
explore the possibility of opening spares 

pools at airports on a flight cycle, in 
order to avoid high delay and cancella¬ 
tion costs of emergency maintenance 
caused by failure of the computer 
systems. 

VIMS Charts Striped Bass 
Striped bass spawning activity and 

the survival of eggs and larvae in 
Virginia tributaries are being studied at 
the Virginia Institute of Marine Science, 
College of William and Mary, under a 
state-federal contract with the National 
Marine Fisheries Service. A sum of 
$340,000 has been allocated for the 
3-year project. 

In announcing the study, VIMS 
director William J. Hargis, Jr. indicated 
that it will be conducted jointly with 
Maryland investigators at Chesapeake 
Biological Laboratory, Solomons. The 
latter are working under a similar 
NMFS contract, and the joint effort will 

English Professor Studies Garden History 
More than one revolution reshaped 

America in the late eighteenth century. 
While George Washington, Thomas 

Jefferson and other patriots were trying 
to rid the colonies of British rule, a 
number of plantation owners—including 
Washington and Jefferson-were quietly 
adapting the more natural style of 
gardening that had suddenly developed 
in England. 

According to Peter Martin, visiting 
associate professor of English at the 
College of William and Mary, "the 
concept of gardening changed drama¬ 
tically during the 18th century in Great 
Britain. A revolution occurred which 
provided that the garden should more 
closely resemble nature." 

Until the 1730s and 1740s, Martin 
explains, the "pleasure" garden of the 
English gentleman was predominantly 
"geometric and constrained by the con¬ 
spicuously shaping hand of 'art'." The 
shrubs were finely trimmed into 
pyramids, boxes or spheres. 

"But as we go further and further 
into the 18th century," says Martin, 
"landscapes become more and more 
open, with large 'prospects' or views, 
emphasized. Plants and shrubs are 
allowed to grow more and more 
naturally, almost wild. Elevation and 
water effects are used more often. The 
management of landscapes becomes 
more free." 

Martin, on sabbatical from his post at 
New England College in Arundel, West 
Sussex, England, has already written a 
book about these changes taking place 
in England in the mid- 1700s. 

Correction 
A paragraph in last week's story on 

the College's asbestos removal project 
contained an incorrect statement. The 
italicized word in the following segment 
should not have been omitted: 

James J. Connolly, Director of 
Facilities Planning and Construction, 
says the bill for asbestos removal this 
summer will not exceed $139,138 for 
the work undertaken by Spinazzolo 
Spray Systems, Inc. In addition to the 
equipment used in Millington and 
Morton, a highly efficient filter and 
exhaust system has been brought in for 
work at The Commons to insure 
against contamination of other areas 
while the work is underway. 

Now the lean, scholarly English 
professor is writing another garden 
history. He spends hours scanning 
letters, documents, accounting ledgers 
and even the archaeological records of 
Colonial Williamsburg in an effort to 
describe a similar, if more gradual 
movement which occurred a few years 
later in the colonies. 

"It is my contention in this book," 
says Martin, "that American landscap¬ 
ing in Virginia, the Carolinas, and some 
parts of Pennsylvania and Maryland did 
not lag far behind these developments 
in England." 

"Virginia as a colony was the most 
closely connected to England," he con¬ 
tinues. "The leading gardeners of 
Virginia-William Byrd, John Custis. 
Carter Burwell, George Washington, 
Thomas Jefferson-were closely in 
touch with what was going on in 
England." 

These gardeners eagerly acquired 
gardening books published by the best 
gardeners in England, Martin says. 
"Thomas Jefferson's Monticello, per¬ 
haps the best documented of colonial 
America, shows the kind of landscape 
design that others in a less thorough 
manner, had done before him," Martin 
says. 

According to the garden historian, 
Jefferson was so concerned for both 
the aesthetics and productiveness of his 
landscapes that he drew no less than 
15 plans for just a few gardens. 

Although plantation owners like 
Jefferson and Washington did the 
designing, slaves usually did the actual 
digging and planting, according to 
Martin. "Generally, the owners hired 
overseers who were specialists in 
gardening to direct the slaves," he 
adds. 

"A good gardener was very hard to 
find in 18th century colonial America," 
says Martin. "People used to lend or 
share their gardeners due to the short 
supply and were quite willing to pay as 
much as 20 pounds a year for 
competent care of their shrubs and 
plants." But though these were reason¬ 
able wages in America, Martin adds, it 
was less than English gardeners earned. 
Few experienced gardeners could be 
persuaded to cross the Atlantic and 
come work in the New World. 

Nevertheless, the designs of many of 
the owners were inspired. Martin 
believes the roots of the naturalist 

movement in gardening lie in the 
emergence of the Whig ideas of 
freedom and democracy in the early 
18th century. 

"Man came to be regarded as free as 
any other of God's creatures-and he 
had a responsibility to behave himself," 
explains Martin. "From this came the 
notion that man ought not dominate 
nature but consult it, get in step with 
it." 

Martin's book, which will cover the 
history, aesthetics, and science of 
gardening in 18th century America, is 
now two-thirds completed and will be 
finished by January, when he leaves 
William and Mary to return to England. 
Colonial Williamsburg is financing his 
research. 

"Garden history is a relatively new 
intellectual-historical field." says Martin. 
"It is rapidly becoming a vital part of 
cultural history-important as the houses 
people built or any of the other fine 
arts. Jefferson, who was no fool, felt 
very strongly about this." 

With that in mind, the visiting William 
and Mary professor hopes his book will 
provide insights into the way ordinary 
people lived in colonial America. Says 
Martin, "It's a very human story." 

provide an assessment for the entire 
Bay. 

The scientists seek to determine if the 
decline in striped bass stocks in East 
Coast waters since 1970 is due to poor 
recruitment of young fish into adult 
populations caused by reduced spawn¬ 
ing or poor survival of eggs and larvae, 
according to Dr. George C. Grant and 
Mr. John E. Olney, who are principal 
investigators of the VIMS study. 
Field investigations are already 
underway in the York River to identify 
spawning sites and to delineate areas 
where highest concentrations of spawn¬ 
ing occurs, to determine distributions of 
eggs and larvae in the spawning and 
nursery habitats, and to assess the 
availability of food needed to support 
larval growth and development. 

Identical studies will be conducted in 
the James River and Rappahannock 
River during the second and third years 
of the project, according to Grant. 
Maryland researchers are working in 
the Potomac River. 

The Chesapeake Bay is believed to 
be the center of East Coast striped bass 
spawning activity. Although spawning 
occurs in fast-moving, freshwater 
portions of rivers from New England to 
the Carolinas. Chesapeake Bay tribu¬ 
taries may contribute a majority of 
young stripers to adult stocks each 
year, Grant said. 

"For this reason, it is important that 
we understand the conditions that 
promote or inhibit their spawning and 
survival in the Bay. These factors may 
be the key to upward or downward 
trends in the numbers of adult fish 
available to fishermen," Grant added. 

Funds to support the work were 
established last winter by Congress, 
which enacted an emergency striped 
bass fund amendment to the 
Anadromous Fish Conservation Act. A 
third of the project's cost will come 
from Virginia's regular annual appro¬ 
priations to VIMS for fishery research. 
The emergency fund is also helping 
support a study of juvenile striped bass 
by VIMS ichthyologist C. E. Richards, 
and proposals have been submitted for 
support of studies on adult stripers. 

Looking Good 
William and Mary Cadet Robert A. Burrell finishes in the top 10 percent of 

his platoon at the ROTC Advanced Camp in Fort Bragg, North Carolina. Here, 
Cadet Burrell receives an award as the team captain of his Company's 
basketball team. 
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Notebook 
Interpersonal Awareness Group 

Miriam Cardi and Neill Watson of the 
j Center for Psychological Services will 
lead weekly group meetings for 
developing communication skills, 
capacity for awareness, empathy and 
expressiveness Tuesday afternoons 
from 2 to 3:30, beginning September 
16. Call the Center for Psychological 
Services at ext. 4231/4388 or visit the 
Center at 125 Richmond Road for 
further information or to sign up. 

Assertiveness Training 

The Center for Psychological Ser¬ 
vices is now accepting registration for 
an assertiveness training course. The 
course is taught by Miriam Cardi and is 
held each Wednesday from 3 to 5, 
September 17 through November 19. 
The course is limited to 12 persons. To 
register, call 253-4231 or visit the 
Center at 125 Richmond Road. 

Catalog Information Desk 

Swem Library has just installed a 
Serials Holdings File Catalog. This file 
will replace the present "flip-file" listing 
current serials holdings of the Library. 

New Faculty 
Cont. from P. I 

(Ph.D., University of Florida). 
Other newcomers are: Fine Arts 

Department-Charles William Moore, 
Visiting Assistant Professor (Ph.D., 
Syracuse University) and Glenna 
Shiflett, Adjunct Instructor (M.Ed., 
University of Virginia); Government 
Department-Christopher J. Berry, Visit¬ 
ing Professor (Ph.D., University of 
London); Robert Rickards, Visiting 
Professor (Ph.D., University of 
Michigan); Wafaa Marei, Visiting Pro¬ 
fessor (Ph.D., Rutgers University); 
Music Department-Elizabeth Bruner, 
Lecturer (B. Mus., Eastman School of 
Music) and Martha Mott, Lecturer; 
Department of Physical Education for 
Women—John M. Charles, Assistant 
Professor (Ed.D., University of 
Oregon); Education Department-David 
Hopkinson, Assistant Professor (Ph.D., 
DePaul University); John Jenkins, 
Adjunct Professor {M.Ed., College of 
William and Mary); Ann R. Massey, 
Adjunct Professor (M.A., College of 
William and Mary); Francis M. 
Aversano, Adjunct Professor (Ph.D., 
Purdue University); Leslie Kaplan, 
Adjunct Professor (EdD., College of 
William and Mary); J. Wade Gilley, 
Adjunct Professor (Secretary of Educa¬ 
tion for Virginia-Ph.D., Virginia Poly¬ 
technic Institute); Geology Depart¬ 
ment-Stephen A. Kish, Visiting Assis¬ 
tant Professor (Ph.D. expected 1980, 
University of North Carolina); Depart¬ 
ment of Classical Studies-John H. 
Oakley, Assistant Professor (M.A., 
Rutgers University); Department of 
Theatre and Speech-Richard Palmer, 
Professor (Ph.D., University of Iowa); 
Department of Physical Education for 
Men-David J. Derrick, Instructor and 
Assistant Track Coach (M.A., Xavier 
University). 

Three new members of the Military 
Science Department's faculty and staff 
are Captain Vernon C. Reming, Assis¬ 
tant Professor; Sergeant First Class 
David M. Pearce, Operations Sergeant; 
and Staff Sergeant Lawrence Bianco, 
Administration Sergeant. 

The new Associate Dean of Students 
for Minority and Commuting Student 
Affairs is Carroll F. S. Hardy (Ed.D., 
Atlanta University). 

Joining the staff of Swem Library is 
Donald Clay Johnson, Reader Services 
Librarian (Ph.D., University of Wis¬ 
consin-Library School). 

The new catalog will give more com¬ 
plete information on serials (complete 
extent of holdings of all serials instead 
of just titles currently received). 

To assist patrons in using the new 
Serials Holdings File, as well as both 
the author/title and subject catalogs, a 
special Catalog Information Desk will 
be staffed from 9 to 11 a.m. and 2 to 4 
p.m. for two weeks starting September 
I. 

Cinema Classes Society 

A new organization for lovers of old 
and special films has been organized. It 
is under the auspices of professors 
Brown and Bledsoe, Department of 
Theatre and Speech, and Mr. Larry 
Gilbert, Director of Educational Media 
and Mr. Wayne Taylor, Manager of 
Television Services. 

The emphasis of the first series is on 
the great directors of the thirties and 
forties, from Chaplin to Lubitch to 
Welles to Renoir and others. Eleven 
films will be shown. 

The films will be shown in Millington 
Auditorium at 8 p.m. on Sunday 
evenings, September 21 through 
December 7. Prices are $10.00 for the 
series or $1.50 for general admission. 
The series is open to the general public. 
For further information call 253-4025. 

College Women's Club 

The College Women's Club will 
holds its traditional Fall Welcome 
Friday, Sept 12 from 3 - 5 p.m. at the 
Wren Building. Registration will be held 
from 3 - 3:30 p.m.. and the members 
will convene in the Wren Chapel for a 
recital of classical guitar music by 
Gerald Kowalski, a graduate student in 
music. There will be a brief business 
meeting following the musical program. 

Mermettes Clinic 

Clinics for prospective Mermettes will 
be held Sept 8, 9, 10, at 7:30 - 9 
p.m., in Adair pool. Men and women 
are welcome. Auditions for the 
Mermettes team will be held Sept. 11 
at 7 p.m. Further details may be 
obtained from the Mermettes coach 
Marcia Milbrath. ext. 4360. 

Get in the Swim 

Hours for recreation swim at Adair 
pooi through September, will be as 
follows: 

Monday through Thursday, 3:30-5 
p.m. 

Through the semester, hours for 
faculty swim are as follows: Monday, 
Wednesday and Friday, 11:15 - 12:15 
p.m. Tuesday and Thursday, 8 - 9 a.m. 

Hours for faculty, staff and students, 
Monday - Thursday, 9 - 11 p.m., 
Friday, 7 - 9 p.m., Saturday and 
Sunday, 1 - 4 p.m. 

I.D.s will be checked at the front 
door. Children under 12 must be 
accompanied by an adult. Older 
children should have evidence of 
college affiliation. Members of faculty 
and staff families will be asked for 
identification. 

ANDREWS HALL OF FINE ARTS 

GALLERY (10-4) 
Through September 19 

James Chalkley. Ceramics 
FOYER (9-5) 

Through September 26 
Soteris Sam Roussi. Paintings 

ZOLLINGER MUSEUM 
Swem Library 

Now through Sept 19 

Watercolors by Robert Keyser. 
Recent gifts to the College Art Col¬ 
lection by Fred Olsen. 

Help Wanted 

The Student Patrol, an auxiliary to 
the campus police that assists them 
during traditional high crime hours, is 
looking for responsible employees. 
Applicants must be in good physical 
condition as the job requires walking 
outside for three hour shifts, and should 
be able to work 12 hours per week 
including nights and weekends. 
Interested persons should apply at the 
Campus Police Office (behind the 
Campus Center). 

A limited number of indoor security 
jobs are also available at Adair and 
Blow Gyms. 

Pay range is $2.80-3.00/hr. for 
Student Patrol and $2.65-2.85/hr. for 
Gym Security. 

Forum of Williamsburg 

Camila Spim. M.D., who has just 
opened an OB/GYN practice in 
Williamsburg, will speak on "The Role 
of Estrogen Therapy in the Treatment 
of Menopause" at the next meeting of 
the Forum of Williamsburg at noon, 
Tuesday, September 9 in the Great 
Hall of the Wren Building. 

This will be a luncheon meeting and 
those planning to attend are asked to 
make reservations with Julie Leverenz, 
director of the Women in Business 
FVogram. ext 4286. Fee for luncheon 
is $4.50. Checks may be sent to Ms. 
Leverenz. made payable to the Women 
in Business Program. 

Official Memorandum 

Deferred Compensation Plan 

On September 4. Charles P. d'Evegnee. Director of the Office of Benefits 
Development, and Linda Frith, Benefits Administrator, will be at the College to 
present the Deferred Compensation Plan to all faculty and classified employees. 
They will be available to meet with individuals in Room 213 of James Blair Hall 
from 10 a.m. - 12:30 p.m. and again that afternoon from 1:30 - 3 p.m. 

Information packets will be distributed to all interested emp>loyees detailing 
the state of Virginia's new Deferred Compensation Plan along with the applica¬ 
tion form for participation in this program. This plan allows employees to 
depwsit a percentage of their salary into an account for them which is 
non-taxable until the time at which withdrawals are made, generally after an 
individual reaches retirement age and when his annual salary is considerably 
less. Anyone having questions concerning the Deferred Condensation Plan is 
encouraged to come by and speak with d'Evegnee and Ms. Frith. No appoint¬ 
ment is necessary. 

Policy For Using William and Mary Hall 

Since we have had some inquiries about the use of William and Mary Hall 
on a daily basis by individuals I feel we should publish the pwlicy as set forth by 
the College Committee on Facilities, Policy and ScheduBng. 

"Members of the student body, faculty, staff and their spouses who wish to 
use selected facilities in the building on an individual basis few recreational 
activities must show appropriate COLLEGE identification. ID cards are avail¬ 
able at no charge at the Campus Police Office. Children in their IMMEDIATE 
families may use these facilities on such occasions when accompanied and 
ATTENDED TO by their parents. Illegal entry, damage or misuse of 
property, and/or conduct inconsistent with policy statements above will 
result in the forfeiture of these privileges." 

William and Mary ID's can be obtained from the Campws Police Office every 
Thursday afternoon from 1:00 p.m. - 3:00 p.m. at no charge. 

Your cooperation in this matter is greatly appreciated 

H. Lester Hooker. Jr. 
Director 

William and Mary Hall 

Procurement of Service Contracts 

Directive Number 4-80, dated July 3, 1980. from the Secretary of Adminis¬ 
tration and Finance has as its subject "Contracting for Services." 

This directive rescinds Directive Number 2-79 (6/27/79) and the Interim 
Guidelines issued by the Attorney General on July 17. 1979. Directive 4-80 
does not alter the contents of these two documents; it only expands on the pro¬ 
cedures to be followed, and stresses that the subject is limited to service 
contracts (as opposed to contracts for p>ersonal services or consultative services). 

Purchases, capital outlay projects, real prop>ery transactions, travel vouchers, 
and personnel actions are covered by other regulations. 

Please note particularly the requirements stated in the "Policies" section of 
Directive 4-80, and be sure that any p>erson who signs a contract has prior 
written approval from the appropriate vice-p>res)dent. or from the President to 
sign such a contract for the College of William and Mary. 

Any questions regarding implementation of Directive 4-80 should be directed 
to me or to Dennis Cogle. 

On behalf of President Graves, we will appreciate, and exp>ect your coopera¬ 
tion in complying with the provisions of Directive 4-80. 

William J. Carter 
Vice President for Business Affairs 
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Calendar 
TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 2 
Bookfair, CC, Ballroom, all day. 
Colonial Echo pictures, William and Mary 

Review, CC. all day. 
Plant Sale, Lobby CC, 11-7 p.m. 
College-wide faculty meeting and reception 

to welcome new faculty members, 
Millington Auditorium. 3:30 p.m. Recep¬ 
tion to follow in Andrews Foyer. 

Alpha Phi Omega (national service fra¬ 
ternity). Rooms A & B, CC, 6 p.m. 

Collegiate Civitans (campus and community 
service organization) Room C, CC, 
7:30 p.m. 

W&M Women's Soccer meeting. Sit 'n 
Bull Room, CC, 8 p.m. 

Hoi Polloi, "The Riots," 9:30-1:30, $1 
cover. 

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 3 
Bookfair, Room D and ballroom, CC, all 

day. 
Colonial Echo, yearbook pictures, CC, all 

day. 
Plant Sale, lobby, CC, 11-7 p.m. 
Hoi Polloi, "The Pilots," 9:30 - 1;30, $1 

cover. 

THURSDAY, SEPTEMBER 4 
Colonial Echo, CC, all day. 

CSO (Christian Science Organization), Room 
D, CC, 5 p.m. 

Canterbury (Episcopal Service), Wren 
Chapel. 5:30 p.m. 

BSO (Black Student Organization), theatre, 
CC, 7 p.m. 

Lacrosse Team, meeting, Botetourt Theatre, 
Swem, 7 p.m. 

Recorder Consort, Room C, CC, 7:30 p.m. 
FCA (Fellowship of Christian Athletes), Sit 

'n Bull, CC, 7:30 p.m. 
Hoi Polloi. Music and Movies. 9 - 12. 

FRIDAY, SEPTEMBER 5 
Colonial Echo, CC, all day. 
ROTC, Ranger/Air Assault demonstration, 

Barksdale Field, 3 p.m. Picnic at Lake 
Matoaka, 4:30 p.m. 

Navigators, theatre, CC, 6 p.m. 
International Circle, "Culture Night." 

banquet and dance. Rooms A & B, CC. 
6 p.m. 

Hoi Polloi, "Prime Time," 4-7, cover 25c, 
30c draft. 

SATURDAY, SEPTEMBER $ 
Ecclesia, Wren Chapel, 9 a.m. 
Organ Recital, Wren Chapel, 11 a.m. 
Student Association, Bluegrass, Lake 

Matoaka, 10 a.m. - 6 p.m. 
Navigators, Room C, CC, 8-11 a.m. 
WMCF, Sit 'n Bull, CC, 9:30 a.m. 
Ecclesia, Wren Chapel, 7 p.m. 
Foreign Film Festival, Andrews Auditorium, 

8 p.m. 
CSA, (Catholic Student Assoc), Square 

Dance. Ballroom, CC, 8 p.m. 
Hoi Polloi, "The Casuals" featuring Johnny 

Sportcoat, 9-1, $1 cover. 
Magic Show, Craft Shop, CC, 2 p.m. 

Magician - Trey Harris. 

SUNDAY, SEPTEMBER 7 
Colonial Echo, CC, all day. 
Lacrosse Tournament Frat Field, 11 a.m. - 

4 p.m. 
New student reception in Wren Courtyard 

and the President's House, 4-6 p.m. 
(Wren Gallery and Porch in case of rain). 

Women's Center Forum, Grad Student 
Center, Armistead Ave., 7:30 p.m. 

MONDAY, SEPTEMBER 8 
Art Sale, lobby, CC 10 a.m. - 7 p.m. 
Colonial Echo, CC, all day. 
BSA (Board of Student Affairs), Room C, 

CC, 3 p.m. 
French Film Festival, Botetourt Theatre. 

Swem, 8 p.m. 
"Chicago," William and Mary Hall, 8 p.m. 

TUESDAY, SEPTEMBER 9 
Colonial Echo, pictures, CC, all day. 
Art Sale, lobby, CC, 10 a.m. - 7 p.m. 

(Atlantic Arts) 
Women in Business luncheon. Wren Great 

Hall, 11 a.m. 
Alpha Phi Omega, Rooms A & B, CC, 

6 p.m. 
Ebony Expressions, rehearsal, theatre, CC. 

6:30 p.m. 
CSA, Wren Chapel. 7:15 p.m. 
Panhellenic rush. Room C. CC, 7 p.m. 
Collegiate Civitans, Room D, CC, 7:30 p.m. 

WEDNESDAY, SEPTEMBER 10 
Colonial Echo pictures, CC, all day. 
Art Sale. CC, all day. 
Mastercard applications, Bank of Virginia, 

lobby, CC, 9-5. 
Panhellenic rush. Room C, CC, 7 p.m. 
Project Plus Forum. Millington Aud., 

7:30 p.m. Steven Rattner, Wash, corres 
for NYTimes spec, in econ & energy. 

Study Skills, Botetourt Theatre, Swem, 
7:30 p.m. 

Employment 
The following positions are open to all 
qualified individuals; however, current 
faculty and classified employees will 
receive first consideration. Except 
where noted, inquiries and applications 
should be made at the Personnel 
Office, 201 James Blair Hall, and not at 
the department where the opening 
exists. Call 229-JOBS (229-5627) for 
an updated listing and 24-hour service. 
An EEO/AA employer. 

RESEARCH ASSISTANT. $5.40 per 
hour, unclassified, part time, 20 
hours per week, average workload. 
College graduate. Administrative 
experience may substitute for up to 2 
years of education. Familiarity with 
Code of Virginia and/or experience 
working with student records. 
Registrar's Office, deadline 9/10. 

CLERK TYPIST C, unclassified, 30-35 
hours per week, temporary employ¬ 
ment. 3-4 months. $4.13 per hour. 
High school graduate plus two years 
clerical experience. Publications 
Office, deadline 9,2. 

CAMPUS POLICE OFFICER, unclassi¬ 
fied, temporary, 60 days. $5.40 per 
hour. High school graduate plus two 
years experience involving public 
contact. Employment in this autho¬ 
rization does not guarantee classified 
erpployment if position becomes 
available. Campus Police Office, 
deadline 9/11. 

RESEARCH SPECIALIST-unclassified 
full-time - $5.40 per hour. Qualifica¬ 
tions - College graduate with degree 
in a natural, physical or social 
science. Experience related to helping 
students cope with personal problems 
may be substituted for education on 
an equivalent time basis. Location - 
Center for Psychological Services, 
deadline 9/4. 

ADMISSIONS COUNSELOR-Starting 
salary $ 11,230 per year. #444. 
Qualifications - College adequate or 
4 years of related experience (ad¬ 
ministrative, clerical, counselling). 
Must possess well developed secre¬ 
tarial and clerical skills. Tying ability 
required. Location - Office of the 
Associate Dean, School of Education, 
deadline 9/4. 

CLERK D (2 vacancies)-starting salary 
$10,270 per year. #539, 547. 
Qualifications - High school graduate 
plus 3 years clerical experience or 
college, 1 year of which must be at a 

responsible level equivalent to a 
Clerk C. Typing test only required for 
#539. Location - Office of the 
Associate Dean, School of Education, 
deadline 9/4. 

DATA ENTRY OPERATOR A-Un- 
classified, part-time - $4.13 per hour. 
(Temporary employment 30 hours 
per week.) Qualifications - High 
school graduate plus 6 months 
experience as a key operator. 
Additional experience as a general 
clerk, typist or key operator may 
substitute for education on an 
equivalent time basis. Location - 
Computer Center, deadline 9/5. 

CLERK TYPIST C-unclassified full- 
time - $4.13 per hour. (Temporary 
employment for 30 days). Qualifica¬ 
tions - High school graduate plus 2 
years clerical experience or college. 
Location - Office of the President, 
deadline 9/8. 

INFORMATION TECHNICIAN-starting 
salary $ 10,270 per year - #529. 
Qualifications - College graduate 
with courses in journalism or public 
relations. Experience in journalism 
or public relations may be sub¬ 
stituted for education on an equiva¬ 
lent time basis. Location - University 
Communications, deadline 9/10. 

COMPUTER PROGRAMMER B-un- 
classified part-time - $7.71 per hour. 
(24-30 hours pier week) Qualifica¬ 
tions, college graduate with major in 
mathematics, engineering, computer 
science or business administration 
and 1 year of experience as a skilled 
programmer. Additional experience 
as a programmer may substitute 
for education on the basis of 1 year 
of experience for 2 yers of education. 
Graduate study in computer science 
may substitute for all but one year 
of experience on an equivalent time 
basis. Location, Computer Center, 
deadline 9/10. 

Classified 
FOR SALE 

STATION WAGON. Pontiac LeMans 72. 
80.000 mi. very good condition, better than 
13 mpg in town, better than 19 mpg hwy. 
$700 or best offer. Must sell, leaving the 
country. Call 229-7922. (9 9) 

GARAGE SALE. Sept. 6. 7 from 10 a.m. 
- 3 p.m.. 522 Prince George St. Leaving the 
country, sell everything: Dinette set. buffet, 
chests, couch, washer. AC. TV etc. (9 2) 

'72 Dodge Monaco. V8. PS. PB. AM FM. 
AC. many extras. $450 or best offer. Call 
220-0117. (9.9) 

FOR SALE: Girl's White French Provincial 
Canopy Bedroom set. including dresser 
w minor, chest of drawers and bookcase 
$200 or best offer. Call 220-0702 after 6 
p.m. (99) 

RANCHER with full basement including 
550 sq. foot family room with fireplace. 
LR. DR. 3 BR. 2 baths, eat-in-kitchen. large 
unfinished workshop area - 2 3 acre wooded 
lot - walk to College, shopping. C.W. upper 
40's. Call 229-6486. (9 9) 

2 matching QUEEN SIZE FLAT SHEETS 
and 2 matching pillow cases $15.00. Call 
229-4617 between 12 - 1 p.m. and 5 - 6:30 
p.m. (9 9) 

CONTEMPORARY LOVE SEAT and 
matching chair - beige and orange $135; two 
chests of drawers $25 each; small dining 
room table $35; small book case $10; chair 
$ 13; red area rug, mirrors and other house¬ 
hold items. Call 253-4312 after 5 p.m. 
(9/16). 

Whirljjool 3-cycle, 21/2 year old, portable 
dryer - $125; Gibson 30" green electric 
range, 5 years old with new heating element 
- $100; Call 229-5783 after 5:30 p.m. 
(9/16). 

SOLID TEAK 4-drawer desk, 42 inches 
wide, 24 inches deep - $75. Call 877-1040. 
(9/16) 

CANNONDALE 2 person tent; waterproof 
w/built in fly; used only a few times. Also 
sealed-cell and foam pads. $135.00 for the 
package. Phone 229-5071 - a.m. and after 5 
p.m. (9/16) 

1971 KARMANN GHIA. reasonable con¬ 
dition. Call Jim at 229-6600. ext. 225. 
between 8 and 11 p.m. (9/2) 

ELECTRIC RANGE. 40" wide with 2 
ovens and storage drawer. Call 220-1547. 
(9 2) 
8-3 4% ASSUMABLE LOAN. 
By owner. $58,500. Charming 3 BR 
rancher on very p'vt 1,2-acre wooded lot on 
cul-de-sac. Quiet friendly neighborhood; 
ideal for young family or retired couple. 
Foyer, large living room w fireplace. Dining 
room w/serene view. 2 full baths, eat-in- 
kitchen. Garage w/ workbench and shelving. 
Storage space in attic. Tastefully deco¬ 
rated, chair rail, oak floors. 3' sliding glass 
door, dishwasher. Central air. storm 
windows, city sewer, vapor barrier, and other 
energy savers. Low maintenance-designed 
landscape w many flowering trees and 
shrubs. Other features include: cypress 
walkway, flower and garden plots, bus route 
on comer. 2 miles from 164; 4 miles from 
town. Call 565-0007 or 229-7927. (9/2) 

FOR RENT 
Immaculate, energy efficient, 3 bedrooms, 

fireplace, fenced yard. York County, bike to 
W&M. $375 mo. Call 565-0024. (9 9) 

RESIDENCE Jamestown Rd. near 
College. LR DR. Rec. room, full basement. 2 
fireplaces, porch, sun deck. Renovated. Sm. 
families only, no pets, lease & deposit 

required $325 mo. - Call 229-4461 after 4 
p.m. or weekends. Available Nov. 1. (9 9) 

Room in five bedroom house. 2.8 miles 
from Campus Center off Jamestown Rd. 
House_ has central air and heat, large yard. 
$ 130.00 per month plus utilities. Available 
August. 1. Call Marshall Miller. 874-5531 
days; or Rich Sherman. 220-2808 after 9 
a.m. (9 2) 

For rent: one bedroom apartment, 
large living room. Close to campus. $225 
plus heat per month. Call 220-2826. (9 2) 

WANTED 

Wanted: Small furnished apartment for 
Visiting Professor August 1 through 
December 18. Department of Fine Arts 
253-4385. 

Teacher looking for loving babysitter for 
pleasant 11 month-old girl. 7 a.m. - 3 p.m. 
Mon. - Fri. In my home preferred. Inquire at 
412-687-4823. After August 24th. call 
229-0625. (9 2) 

HELP! Mother needs student to watch 2 
school age children after school (3:15 to 
5:15) Good pay. Call 220-0606 after 5 p.m. 
(9.9) 

Lifeguards for Williamsburg Inn. Morning 
hours. Advanced Lifesaving required; Water 
Safety Instructor preferred. Contact "Key" 
229-1000. ext. 3120. (9 9) 

HOUSECLEANING wanted. $4 per hour. 
Must have own transportation. Call 
565-1312. (9/16) 

INSTRUCTOR NEEDS RIDE. Portsmouth 
to Williamsburg by 8 a.m. Williamsburg to 
Norfolk by 12 noon, Monday, Wednesday 
and Friday. Call coUect (804) 483-4568. 
(9/16) 


